
450 copies of this document were printed by the South Dakota
Legislative Research Council at a cost of $.021 per page. v  Insertions into existing statutes are indicated by underscores.

Deletions from existing statutes are indicated by overstrikes.

State of South Dakota
SEVENTY-SIXTH SESSION

LEGISLATIVE ASSEMBLY, 2001

704E0214 CONFERENCE COMMITTEE ENGROSSED  NO. 

HB 1142 - 03/02/2001
This bill has been extensively amended (hoghoused) and may no longer be consistent
with the original intention of the sponsor.

Introduced by: Representatives Kooistra, Elliott, Garnos, Glenski, Holbeck, Lange, and
Olson (Mel) and Senator McIntyre

FOR AN ACT ENTITLED, An Act to amend the General Appropriations Act for fiscal year1

2001.2

BE IT ENACTED BY THE LEGISLATURE OF THE STATE OF SOUTH DAKOTA:3

Section 1. That certain programs in chapter 14 of the 2000 Session Laws be amended to read4

as follows:5

BOARD OF REGENTS6

Northern State University7

Personal Services, delete "$6,735,806" and insert "$7,789,6068

Operating Expenses, delete "$1,002,685" and insert "$1,300,005"9

Adjust all totals accordingly.10

Section 2. That certain programs in chapter 14 of the 2000 Session Laws be amended to read11

as follows:12

DEPARTMENT OF HEALTH13

Administration, Secretary of Health14



- 2 - HB 1142

Operating Expenses, delete "$629,145" and insert "$1,629,145".1

Adjust all totals accordingly.2

Section 3. The fund source used to support the other fund expenditure authority appropriated3

by section 2 of this Act shall be the youth-at-risk education trust fund established in § 13-14-6.4

Section 4. Any expenditure authority and cash appropriated by this Act which are unspent5

at the end of fiscal year 2001 shall be carried over to fiscal year 2002.6

Section 5. This Act is effective June 22, 2001.7


