
HB No. 1142 Page 1

AN ACT

ENTITLED, An Act to amend the General Appropriations Act for fiscal year 2001.

BE IT ENACTED BY THE LEGISLATURE OF THE STATE OF SOUTH DAKOTA:

Section 1. That certain programs in chapter 14 of the 2000 Session Laws be amended to read as

follows:

BOARD OF REGENTS

Northern State University

Personal Services, delete "$6,735,806" and insert "$7,789,606

Operating Expenses, delete "$1,002,685" and insert "$1,300,005"

Adjust all totals accordingly.

Section 2. That certain programs in chapter 14 of the 2000 Session Laws be amended to read as

follows:

DEPARTMENT OF HEALTH

Administration, Secretary of Health

Operating Expenses, delete "$629,145" and insert "$1,629,145".

Adjust all totals accordingly.

Section 3. The fund source used to support the other fund expenditure authority appropriated by

section 2 of this Act shall be the youth-at-risk education trust fund established in § 13-14-6.

Section 4. Any expenditure authority and cash appropriated by this Act which are unspent at the

end of fiscal year 2001 shall be carried over to fiscal year 2002.

Section 5. This Act is effective June 22, 2001.



 An Act to amend the General Appropriations Act for fiscal year 2001.

==================================================
   I certify that the attached Act
originated in the

HOUSE as Bill No. 1142

____________________________
Chief Clerk

==================================================

____________________________
Speaker of the House

Attest:

____________________________
Chief Clerk

____________________________
President of the Senate

Attest:

____________________________
Secretary of the Senate

House Bill No.   1142  
File No. ____
Chapter No. ______

==================================================
   Received at this Executive Office
this _____ day of _____________ ,

20____ at ____________ M.

By _________________________
for the Governor

==================================================

     The attached Act is hereby
approved this ________ day of
______________ , A.D., 20___

____________________________
Governor

==================================================
STATE OF SOUTH DAKOTA,

ss.
Office of the Secretary of State

     Filed ____________ , 20___
at _________ o'clock __ M.

____________________________
Secretary of State

By _________________________
Asst. Secretary of State


