
350 copies of this document were printed by the South Dakota
Legislative Research Council at a cost of $.027 per page. v

 Insertions into existing statutes are indicated by underscores.
Deletions from existing statutes are indicated by overstrikes.

State of South Dakota
SEVENTY-NINTH SESSION

LEGISLATIVE ASSEMBLY, 2004

400J0333 SENATE APPROPRIATIONS COMMITTEE

ENGROSSED  NO. HB 1031 - 02/23/2004
This bill has been extensively amended (hoghoused) and may no longer be consistent
with the original intention of the sponsor.

Introduced by: The Committee on Appropriations at the request of the Bureau of Finance and
Management

FOR AN ACT ENTITLED, An Act to revise the General Appropriations Act for fiscal year1

2004 for the Departments of Social Services, Education, Corrections, and Human Services.2

BE IT ENACTED BY THE LEGISLATURE OF THE STATE OF SOUTH DAKOTA:3

Section 1. That section 7 of chapter 2 of the 2003 Session Laws be amended to read as4

follows:5

DEPARTMENT OF SOCIAL SERVICES6

Medical Services7

Operating Expenses, General Funds, delete "$83,126,535" and insert "$81,305,557"8

Operating Expenses, Federal Funds, delete "$209,308,815" and insert "$233,407,510"9

Adjust all totals accordingly.10

Section 2. That section 11 of chapter 2 of the 2003 Session Laws be amended to read as11

follows:12

DEPARTMENT OF EDUCATION13

State Aid to General Education14



- 2 - HB 1031

Operating Expenses, General Funds, delete "$268,151,418" and insert "$218,151,418"1

Adjust all totals accordingly.2

Section 3. That section 15 of chapter 2 of the 2003 Session laws be amended to read as3

follows:4

DEPARTMENT OF CORRECTIONS5

Juvenile Community Corrections6

Operating Expenses, General Funds, delete "$7,268,439" and insert "$6,942,053"7

Adjust all totals accordingly.8

Section 4. That section 16 of chapter 2 of the 2003 Session Laws be amended to read as9

follows:10

DEPARTMENT OF HUMAN SERVICES11

Developmental Disabilities12

Operating Expenses, General Funds, delete "$24,611,973" and insert "$22,658,200"13

South Dakota Developmental Center–Redfield14

Personal Services, General Funds, delete "$5,313,143" and insert "$4,851,117"15

Operating Expenses, General Funds, delete "$1,740,880" and insert "$1,628,822"16

Rehabilitation Services17

Operating Expenses, General Funds, delete "$2,720,897" and insert "$2,646,233"18

Human Services Center19

Personal Services, General Funds, delete "$16,652,285" and insert "$16,445,922"20

Operating Expenses, General Funds, delete "$8,082,977" and insert "$8,047,875"21

Community Mental Health22

Personal Services, General Funds, delete "$382,887" and insert "$376,193"23

Operating Expenses, General Funds, delete "$10,248,064" and insert "$9,916,479"24



- 3 - HB 1031

Adjust all totals accordingly.1

Section 5. This Act is effective June 15, 2004.2


