
HB No. 1031 Page 1

AN ACT

ENTITLED, An Act to revise the General Appropriations Act for fiscal year 2004 for the

Departments of Social Services, Education, Corrections, and Human Services.

BE IT ENACTED BY THE LEGISLATURE OF THE STATE OF SOUTH DAKOTA:

Section 1. That section 7 of chapter 2 of the 2003 Session Laws be amended to read as follows:

DEPARTMENT OF SOCIAL SERVICES

Medical Services

Operating Expenses, General Funds, delete "$83,126,535" and insert "$81,305,557"

Operating Expenses, Federal Funds, delete "$209,308,815" and insert "$233,407,510"

Adjust all totals accordingly.

Section 2. That section 11 of chapter 2 of the 2003 Session Laws be amended to read as follows:

DEPARTMENT OF EDUCATION

State Aid to General Education

Operating Expenses, General Funds, delete "$268,151,418" and insert "$218,151,418"

Adjust all totals accordingly.

Section 3. That section 15 of chapter 2 of the 2003 Session laws be amended to read as follows:

DEPARTMENT OF CORRECTIONS

Juvenile Community Corrections

Operating Expenses, General Funds, delete "$7,268,439" and insert "$6,942,053"

Adjust all totals accordingly.

Section 4. That section 16 of chapter 2 of the 2003 Session Laws be amended to read as follows:

DEPARTMENT OF HUMAN SERVICES

Developmental Disabilities

Operating Expenses, General Funds, delete "$24,611,973" and insert "$22,658,200"



HB No. 1031 Page 2

South Dakota Developmental Center–Redfield

Personal Services, General Funds, delete "$5,313,143" and insert "$4,851,117"

Operating Expenses, General Funds, delete "$1,740,880" and insert "$1,628,822"

Rehabilitation Services

Operating Expenses, General Funds, delete "$2,720,897" and insert "$2,646,233"

Human Services Center

Personal Services, General Funds, delete "$16,652,285" and insert "$16,445,922"

Operating Expenses, General Funds, delete "$8,082,977" and insert "$8,047,875"

Community Mental Health

Personal Services, General Funds, delete "$382,887" and insert "$376,193"

Operating Expenses, General Funds, delete "$10,248,064" and insert "$9,916,479"

Adjust all totals accordingly.

Section 5. This Act is effective June 15, 2004.



 An Act to revise the General Appropriations Act for fiscal year 2004 for the Departments of Social
Services, Education, Corrections, and Human Services.

==================================================
   I certify that the attached Act
originated in the

HOUSE as Bill No. 1031

____________________________
Chief Clerk

==================================================

____________________________
Speaker of the House

Attest:

____________________________
Chief Clerk

____________________________
President of the Senate

Attest:

____________________________
Secretary of the Senate

House Bill No.   1031  
File No. ____
Chapter No. ______

==================================================
   Received at this Executive Office
this _____ day of _____________ ,

20____ at ____________ M.

By _________________________
for the Governor

==================================================

     The attached Act is hereby
approved this ________ day of
______________ , A.D., 20___

____________________________
Governor

==================================================
STATE OF SOUTH DAKOTA,

ss.
Office of the Secretary of State

     Filed ____________ , 20___
at _________ o'clock __ M.

____________________________
Secretary of State

By _________________________
Asst. Secretary of State


