
SB No. 19 Page 1

AN ACT

ENTITLED, An Act to revise the General Appropriations Act for fiscal year 2006 regarding

appropriations to the Board of Regents and the Department of Corrections.

BE IT ENACTED BY THE LEGISLATURE OF THE STATE OF SOUTH DAKOTA:

Section 1. That section 13 of chapter 30 of the 2005 Session Laws be amended to read as

follows:

BOARD OF REGENTS

University of South Dakota School of Medicine

Personal Services, Federal Funds, delete "$10,032,263" and insert "$10,732,263"

Operating Expenses, Federal Funds, delete $7,417,467" and insert "$7,667,467"

Personal Services, Other Funds, delete "$6,635,911" and insert "$6,779,938"

Operating Expenses, Other Funds, delete "$3,067,626" and insert $3,573,599"

F.T.E., delete "360.1" and insert "382.1"

Adjust all totals accordingly.

South Dakota State University Proper

Personal Services, Federal Funds, delete "$3,639,831" and insert "$4,619,831"

Operating Expenses, Federal Funds, delete "$12,061,290"  and insert "$14,239,362"

Operating Expenses, Other Funds, delete "$41,788,147" and insert "$43,044,547"

Adjust all totals accordingly.

Black Hills State University

F.T.E., delete "413.4" and insert "417.9"

Adjust all totals accordingly.

Dakota State University

Personal Services, Federal Funds, delete "$417,624" and insert "$617,624"



SB No. 19 Page 2

Operating Expenses, Federal Funds, delete "$1,711,124" and insert "$2,111,124"

Personal Services, Other Funds, delete "$7,089,266" and insert "$7,164,266"

Operating Expenses, Other Funds, delete "$7,225,718" and insert "$7,290,718"

F.T.E., delete "258.5" and insert "264.5"

Adjust all totals accordingly.

Section 2. That section 15 of chapter 30 of the 2005 Session Laws be amended to read as

follows:

DEPARTMENT OF CORRECTIONS

Pheasantland Industries

Personal Services, Other Funds, delete "$585,754" and insert "$685,754"

Operating Expenses, Other Funds, delete "$2,272,548" and insert "$3,772,548"

Adjust all totals accordingly.

Section 3. The effective date of this Act is June 21, 2006.



 An Act to revise the General Appropriations Act for fiscal year 2006 regarding appropriations to
the Board of Regents and the Department of Corrections.

==================================================
   I certify that the attached Act
originated in the

SENATE as Bill No. 19

____________________________
Secretary of the Senate

==================================================

____________________________
President of the Senate

Attest:

____________________________
Secretary of the Senate

____________________________
Speaker of the House

Attest:

____________________________
Chief Clerk

Senate Bill No.   19  
File No. ____
Chapter No. ______

==================================================
   Received at this Executive Office
this _____ day of _____________ ,

20____ at ____________ M.

By _________________________
for the Governor

==================================================

     The attached Act is hereby
approved this ________ day of
______________ , A.D., 20___

____________________________
Governor

==================================================
STATE OF SOUTH DAKOTA,

ss.
Office of the Secretary of State

     Filed ____________ , 20___
at _________ o'clock __ M.

____________________________
Secretary of State

By _________________________
Asst. Secretary of State


